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Opportunity
Category

Explanation:

Funding
Instrument

Type:

Grant

Category of
Funding
Activity:

Natural Resources

Category
Explanation:

Expected
Number of

Awards:

CFDA
Number(s):

15.639 -- Tribal
Wildlife Grants

Cost Sharing
or Matching

Requirement:

No

applications that
are emailed to your
WSFR Regional
Office, the full
application must be
received no later
than the
application due
date. Mailed
applications must
be postmarked no
later than the
application due
date.

Current
Closing Date

for
Applications:

Jun 21, 2024
Electronically
submitted
applications must
be submitted no
later than 11:59 PM,
ET, on the listed
application due
date indicated in
GrantSolutions and
Grants.gov (June
21, 2024). For
applications that
are emailed to your
WSFR Regional
Office, the full
application must be
received no later
than the
application due
date. Mailed
applications must
be postmarked no
later than the
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application due
date.

Archive Date: Oct 23, 2026

Estimated
Total

Program
Funding:

$ 6,200,000

Award
Ceiling:

$200,000

Award Floor: $10,000

Eligibility

Eligible
Applicants:

Native American tribal governments (Federally recognized)

Additional
Information

on
Eligibility:

Participation is limited to federally recognized Tribal
governments listed in the current Federal Register Notice of
Indian Entities Recognized and Eligible to Receive Services
from the United States Bureau of Indian Affairs. This is the
official listing of all federally recognized Tribes in the United
States pursuant to Section 104 of the Federally Recognized
Indian Tribe List Act of 1994 (Pub. L. 103-454; 108 Stat. 4791-
4792). The most recent Notice was published in the Federal
Register, 89 FR 944 (January 8, 2024). Tribal organizations and
other entities may participate as subrecipients or contractors
to federally recognized Tribal governments. Tribal contact
information is available in the BIA Tribal Leaders
Directory.Applicant Tribes must bring all administrative and
fiscal reporting for any open TWG Program grants up to date
in order to be eligible to apply for new funds. Applicants will
be notified within five business days upon receiving proposals
noting any outstanding reporting issues that need to be
addressed. Tribes will then have 30 days to bring these grants
into compliance. Proposals from Tribes that have not brought
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past due reports (e.g., interim or final performance reports, or
interim or final financial status reports) up to date in this 30-
day period will be found ineligible and excluded from further
consideration in the FY 2024 TWG Program cycle.When an
applicant is carrying two or more active TWG projects while
applying for another, the Service has an administrative
obligation to verify that there are no correctable problems in
implementing the existing awards. We will review the reasons
why those grants are still open before proceeding with further
consideration. Tribes that demonstrate their effective use of
TWG Program funds will not be affected. Tribes that have
taken no significant action on any one of their preexisting
awards will not be considered eligible to apply for new TWG
Program funds until any correctable problems are resolved.
Possible resolutions might be for the Tribe to demonstrate
progress in the agreed-upon activities of an inactive grant,
demonstrate that the assertion of “no action” is incorrect, or
the Tribe may cancel the grant so that the obligated funds
may be recovered and made available to other Tribes in the
next grant cycle.

Additional Information

Agency
Name:

Fish and Wildlife Service

Description: The Tribal Wildlife Grants (TWG) Program was created to
support the development and implementation of programs
for the benefit of wildlife and their habitats and species of
Tribal cultural or traditional importance, including those that
are not hunted or fished. The TWG Program is part of the
Congressionally-authorized State and Tribal Wildlife Grant
(STWG) Program which provides wildlife conservation grants
to States, Commonwealths, and to the District of Columbia,
U.S. Territories, and Tribes under provisions of the Fish and
Wildlife Act of 1956 and the Fish and Wildlife Coordination
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Act. The TWG Program provides opportunities for federally
recognized Tribes to engage in fish and wildlife conservation
efforts on Tribal lands. Many of the TWG Program-funded
project activities increase fish and wildlife populations,
allowing for hunting and fishing opportunities on and off
Tribal lands. Additionally, the TWG Program funds project
activities that align and assist the Service with Endangered
Species Act (ESA) conservation activities supporting species
down-listing (threatened to endangered), delisting (removal
from the list due to species recovery), and preventing new
species listings under the ESA.

Link to
Additional

Information:

Grantor
Contact

Information:

If you have difficulty accessing the full announcement
electronically, please contact:

DJ Monette
dj_monette@fws.gov

U.S. Fish and Wildlife Service - National Native American
Programs
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